## Leon County School Board Bid # 5405-2017 - Revised 10/18/2016 (Pay Scale Adjustment Only)/ Revised 7/10/17 (Additional Negotiated Position)/ Revised 10/19/18 (Additional Negotiated Position) Temporary Personnel Services

Department: Purchasing/ Opening Date: August 25, 2016 @ 2:00p.m. EST

	Department: Furthashig/ Opening Date: August 25, 2010 @ 2:00p.ini. ES1								
Item #	Position Title	Pay Range	A & Associates – Cancelled Contract 9/29/2016	Adecco	DES of Florida, LLC	Hire Quest d/b/a Trojan Labor	IOS Acquisitions, LLC	Kelly Services, Inc.	
	ry Award ate Award		Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	
7	CATEGORY 1 – OFFICE SUPPORT								
1	Office Clerk	\$8.50 - \$14.93	29.25	33.61	No Bid	33	27.45	31	
2	Clerical Assistant	\$10.32 - \$17.17	29.25	33.61	No Bid	33	27.45	31	
3	Secretary	\$11.87 - \$19.76	29.25	33.61	No Bid	33	27.45	31	
4	Executive Secretary	\$13.64 - \$26.13	29.25	33.61	28.95	33	27.45	31	
5	Account Clerk	\$11.87 - \$19.76	29.25	33.61	No Bid	33	27.45	31	
6	Data Entry Operator	\$8.50 - \$14.93	29.25	33.61	No Bid	33	27.45	31	
7	Computer Support Technician	\$13.64 - \$26.13	29.25	33.61	No Bid	33	27.45	31	
				CATEGORY 2 – TRADES	AND LABORERS				
8	Food Service Worker	\$8.50 - \$14.93	29.25	No Bid	No Bid	38	No Bid	No Bid	
9	Electrician	\$15.68 - \$26.13	29.25	39.34	No Bid	38	No Bid	No Bid	
10	Painter	\$14.34 - \$23.90	29.25	39.34	No Bid	38	No Bid	No Bid	
11	HVAC Mechanic	\$15.68 - \$26.13	29.25	39.34	No Bid	38	No Bid	No Bid	
12	Maintenance Worker/Laborer	\$8.50 - \$14.93	29.25	39.34	No Bid	38	No Bid	No Bid	
13	Custodian	\$8.50 - \$14.93	29.25	39.34	No Bid	38	No Bid	No Bid	
14	Courier	\$8.50 - \$14.93	29.25	39.34	No Bid	33	No Bid	No Bid	
CATEGORY 3 – MANAGEMENT AND ADMINISTRATION									
15	Project Manager	\$21.74 - \$36.22	17.75	33.61	28.50	33	27.45	31	
16	Coordinator	\$24.99 - \$41.66	17.75	33.61	27.75	33	27.45	31	
17	Director	\$28.75 - \$55.11	17.75	33.61	25.95	33	27.45	31	

Bidders are hereby notified that failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes and Board Policy 6320.02, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Offers received from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Opened By: June Kail Date: 8/25/2016 Recorded By: Nancy Scott Date:: 8/25/2016

## Leon County School Board Bid # 5405-2017 – Revised 10/18/2016 (Pay Scale Adjustment Only)/ Revised 7/10/17 (Additional Negotiated Position)/ Revised 10/19/18 (Additional Negotiated Position) Temporary Personnel Services

Department: Purchasing/ Opening Date: August 25, 2016 @ 2:00p.m. EST

	I		Department: P	urchasing/ Opening Date:	August 25, 2016 @ 2:00p.	m. ESI		T
Item #	Position Title	Pay Range	Infinity Staffing Solutions, d/b/a Lyneer Staffing	Moten Tate, Inc.	Small Business Information & Resources Corp. (Bidder does not meet minimum qualifications)	SS Solutions, LLC – Assumption of Primary 9/29/2016		
	<mark>y Award</mark> ate Award		Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)	Firm Markup (%)
				CATEGORY 1 – OFFI	CE SUPPORT			
1	Office Clerk	\$8.50 - \$14.93	25.5	35	-	No Bid		
2	Clerical Assistant	\$10.32 - \$17.17	25.5	35	-	No Bid		
3	Secretary	\$11.87 - \$19.76	25.5	35	-	No Bid		
4	Executive Secretary	\$13.64 - \$26.13	25.5	35	-	No Bid		
5	Account Clerk	\$11.87 - \$19.76	25.5	35	-	No Bid		
6	Data Entry Operator	\$8.50 - \$14.93	25.5	35	-	No Bid		
7	Computer Support Technician	\$13.64 - \$26.13	25.5	35	-	No Bid		
	Classroom Behavior Assistant (Added 10/19/18)	\$13.00 - \$21.67	25.5					
				CATEGORY 2 – TRADES	AND LABORERS			
8	Food Service Worker	\$8.50 - \$14.93	30	40	-	No Bid		
9	Electrician	\$15.68 - \$26.13	28	40	-	No Bid		
10	Painter	\$14.34 - \$23.90	28	40	-	No Bid		
11	HVAC Mechanic	\$15.68 - \$26.13	28	40	-	No Bid		
12	Maintenance Worker/Laborer	\$8.50 - \$14.93	28	40	-	No Bid		
13	Custodian	\$8.50 - \$14.93	28	40	-	No Bid		
14	Courier	\$8.50 - \$14.93	28	40	-	No Bid		
	Maintenance Dept. Manager (Added 7/10/17)	\$20.74 - \$34.55	28					
	,			GORY 3 – MANAGEMENT	AND ADMINISTRATION			
15	Project Manager	\$21.74 - \$36.22	25.5	35	-	18.66		
16	Coordinator	\$24.99 - \$41.66	25.5	35	-	18.66		
17	Director	\$28.75 - \$55.11	25.5	35	-	18.66	·	

Bidders are hereby notified that failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes and Board Policy 6320.02, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Offers received from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Opened By: June Kail Date: 8/25/2016 Recorded By: Nancy Scott Date:: 8/25/2016